
REF: 1680H1-vlc PRICE: €1,900,000JÁVEA, ADSUBIA

• Year of Build 2025
• Alarm system
• Basement
• BBQ area
• Carport
• Close to golf course
• Close to services
• En-suite Bathroom
• Fenced plot
• Flat plot

BEDROOMS

5
BATHROOMS

5
BUILD

388m²
PLOT

1000m²
This striking contemporary villa offers the perfect blend of
luxury, comfort, and design, all set on a generous private
plot. Crafted with high quality materials and attention to
detail, the property is a showcase of modern architecture
combined with functional elegance. Its thoughtfully designed
layout and spacious interiors make it ideal for both everyday
living and entertaining.  The villa features five en suite
bedrooms, each offering ample space, privacy, and natural
light. The open plan living areas are complemented by a
beautifully designed kitchen that combines sleek aesthetics
with practical functionality. A cinema and multipurpose room
adds an extra layer of comfort and versatility, while an
advanced illumination project enhances the ambiance
throughout the home.  The exterior is just as impressive,
with large terraces and covered porches that extend the
living space outdoors. A private pool and jacuzzi form the
centrepiece of a custom landscaped garden, creating a
serene setting for relaxation or gatherings. The dedicated
barbecue area is perfect for alfresco dining, and the parking
area with pergola offers both shelter and style.  Comfort is
guaranteed year round with an efficient aerothermal air
conditioning system. The villa also features extended home
automation, allowing full control of lighting, climate, and
security systems. With options for personalization
throughout, this villa offers a smart and stylish lifestyle
tailored to modern living.  Distance to amenities: 
-Supermarket: 400m-Restaurant: 220m-Pharmacy:
500m-Medical emergency centre: 4.2km-International
school: 1.5km 
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